
Pretzel cart serving warm, fresh pretzels in 

either salty or sugar and cinnamon flavour. 

PRETZEL CART 

SUITABLE FOR: All ages.  
 
GREAT FOR: Birthday Parties, Weddings, Fun Days, 
corporate events, Oktoberfest events, charity  
fundraisers, student freshers fairs  
 
SET UP: Outside – must be under cover  
 
REQUIRES: n/a  
 
SIZE: 1m (W) x 1m (L) x 1.83m (H)  
 
WHAT’S INCLUDED: 
 - Mobile pretzel cart and warmer 
 - 60 portions of pretzels 
 - paper bags 
 
OPTIONAL EXTRAS: 
 - Attendant to serve  
 - Branded cart and paper bags  

Serve freshly baked, warm pretzels at your event. Our 
pretzel cart hire is a tasty treat that's perfect for office 
parties, corporate events, Oktoberfest events and 
community fund raisers. A traditional pretzel is a 
pastry snack made from dough and twisted into the 
distinctive knot shape. We can supply you with salty 
or sweet sugar and cinnamon pretzels, both with 
chocolate dipping sauce, served from our funfair style 
pretzel cart. The cart is compact and mobile so can be 
set up at almost any event venue, both inside or 
outside. 

Our pretzel carts offer more than simply food 
service—they’re a chance for promotion. We can fully 
brand the pretzel cart to display your company’s 
colours and logo, making it an eye-catching display 
for your event. We can also supply branded paper 
bags to serve the pretzels in. 
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COMBINE WITH 

CUSTOMER REVIEWS 

""The attendant arrived early for set up and was very 
good with minimum help needed from myself" 

"Very helpful, very efficient... no fuss service. 10 out of 10, 
many thanks!" 

Bratwurst Stall Mobile Bar Candyfloss Cart 


